
Monthly Expenditure Report

Monthly Cash Reconciliation

Beginning Balance Total Spent Remaining
Balance Outstanding Commitments Net Available

$41065.11 $2248.41 $38816.70 $3000.00 $1000.00 $34816.70

Monthly Cash Flow Analysis

Budget Category Adopted Budget Total Spent this
Month

Unspent Budget
Balance Outstanding Net Available

Office

$28500.00

$248.41

$15816.70 

$0.00

$15816.70 Outreach $2000.00 $0.00

Elections $0.00 $0.00

Community
Improvement Project $9000.00 $0.00 $9000.00 $0.00 $9000.00

Neighborhood Purpose
Grants $4500.00 $0.00 $4000.00 $3000.00 $1000.00

Funding Requests Under Review: $0.00 Encumbrances: $1000.00 Previous Expenditures: $10934.89

Expenditures

# Vendor Date Description Budget Category Sub-category Total

1 STORAGE ETC.
WARNER CE 05/01/2020 Storage

General
Operations
Expenditure

Office $217.00

2 ONEGENERATION 05/08/2020 covid 19 emergency supplies
General

Operations
Expenditure

Outreach $1000.00

3 GRASSHOPPER.COM 05/13/2020 phones
General

Operations
Expenditure

Office $31.41

4 SMART AND FINAL
324 05/14/2020 covid 19 donation to west

valley food pantry
General

Operations
Expenditure

Outreach $1000.00

 Subtotal: $2248.41

Outstanding Expenditures

# Vendor Date Description Budget Category Sub-category Total

1
Valley Cultural

Center DBA Valley
Cultural Foundation 

06/05/2020

Community support to include
1 10x10 Booth at 10 Sunday
Concerts and July 4th to
include tent, table,chairs and
electrical outlet. Support for
the Children's Performance
Series 

Neighborhood
Purpose Grants $3000.00

 Subtotal: Outstanding $3000.00

Reporting Month: May 2020

NC Name: Woodland Hills-Warner
Center Neighborhood Council

Budget Fiscal Year: 2019-2020



Storage Etc. -  Warner
6030 Canoga Ave
Woodland Hills, CA  91367
818-347-7160

Payment Receipt

Date Printed May 1, 2020
W.H. W.C. NEIGHBORHOOD COUNCIL Payment Date May 1, 2020 5:10 PM
c/o: PAUL LAWLER
20929 VENTURA BLVD.STE. 47-535
WOODLAND HILLS  CA  91367

Unit 3149
Receipt Number 95515
Paid Thru May 31, 2020
By   FT

                                                                                    
Date Unit Description    Charge Discount      Tax     Total   Payment Method
05/01/20 3149 Rent 5/1-5/31    208.00     0.00     0.00    208.00    208.00 Master Card
05/01/20 3149 Insurance 5/1-5/31      9.00     0.00     0.00      9.00      9.00 Master Card

Taxes                                               0.00
Payment (less tax)                          217.00   
Payment Subtotal                           217.00
Credits Applied                               0.00
Refunds Applied                             0.00
Total Applied to Account               217.00

Current Account Balance             0.00
Paid By                                       Master Card *****7895
Paid Thru Date                            May 31, 2020

Transaction Type  Sale
Authorization  022494
Reference  84277

I agree to pay the above amount according to the card issuer statement.

x _________________________________________________
                        



From: s.kaufinan@whcouncil-org'

To: lawlerpaul@ad.com,

Su$ect Fwd: WHWCNC - Approval of Errelgency Funding

DaE: Fri, MaY 8, NT 11:49 am

Attachments: wHWCNC - CCC.pdf (102K), WHWCNC - OneGeneration.pdf (99K)

Hi Paul,
please see blow - this is the DONE approval for Connecting and Caring Commrmity (Goodies to Go) and One

Genemtion.

Begrn forwarded message :

From : Semee Park <semee.park@laci-ty.ofg>
Subiec'E WHWCNC - ApProval of Emergency Funding
Date: April 30, 2O2O at 4:4O:O4 PM PDT
To: Sheppard Kaufrnan <s. kaufrnan@whcouncil-org>
Cc: Vanessa Senano <Vanessa.Serrano@lacity.org>, Clerk NCFunding
<clcrk. ncfi rE d illg@|refiY=erg >

Dear Sheppard,

Thank you for WHWCNC's submissircn of the COVID-19 Eneqency Funding Plan-

The Depargnent of Neighborfiood Emporerment (Department) is apgoving your submlssinn qr behdf of

for meals and popuP food Pantry

Thank you no bnflict of interest exists between you and the organization.

2. OneGeneration - $1,000 to manufacture personal protective gear

no conllict of interest exists between you and the organization.

We hope this is helpful, and reach out with any questions you may have-

Semee Park

Director of Neighborhood Council Operations

Department of iieighborhood Empou'erment
14410 Sylvan St. 3rd Floor
Los Angeles. CA 91401

Office | 818-374-6851

Email I Semee. Park(rZ.!gsj$.org

Trailblazing the lorgest civic engagement system, virtually

wwr,r'.EmoowerLA.ors EVG

Connecting a



From: SSexton@onegeneration'dg'

To: hrrlerPaul@ad'com'

Ce jhauss@onegeneralion-org'

Su$ect ThankYou fiom ONEgeneratbn

Date: Fri, MaY 8, 2020 12:OAPn

Attachments:oNEgeneratirnSeniorMealPrognanDonationfiorrWoodlardHills
Neighborhood Council MaY

Thank you for woodland Hils Neighborhood council's kind and generous donation today towards

food distribution progrilns. Your g"ooority will help many lowiome vulnemble se'lriors in need c

Dear Paul,

health crisis.

I will email you a thank you letter for your records on Monday. Please let me know if you need

this time.

Be well and thank You again'

Sue

Sue Sexton

Director of Development & Marketing

oNEgeneration - Adult Daycare, childcare, Administrative offices

17400 Victory Blvd.

Van Nuys, CA 91406

ONEgeneration Senior Enrichment Center

18255 Victory Blvd.

Reseda CA 91335

81 8-708-4756

Fax: 81 8-708-6620

s qexloo@ QN-E g cncra!-g[ o-rg



Tn*ttx You!

"Our mission is to enrich the lives of seniors,

children, and their families, throughout

ou r diverse com mu n ities."

ffi .H':"r
**l# L-r 'j



QauL I/r"Jr- dW L+)

woadllr,i"tllt Nc
Gf,E}E&iTIOil

1ifl}O VICTMY BLVD

vdt t{.rrs c8 ctffi
{ul8t ilr8 6la3

[tD Btft#ry2ffi76.1

Tsro I[t: ?
nsrchaft Itr: eaetaj6289l64
R<qd l{e.: t@l

Phone 0rder Sale

miffi [n; frrifr
ffilmffi Entry futhil: l(eved fifl

Iotal;

ttuffi/e

Inv$; ffiffi.

fumvd; 0rlim

Ats C*:
C!fl Cd;

ffiIC fl:

$ l,&#,ffi

lir41:fl

foer e*; ffiHS

Betdr$: ffiffi
ll
I

H

Da^r,J14"

0ByilyilI/lixi0v53[$5

L. tr"uJ
I€SRiPIIGI: 'Ntt-z

WtW'rrr,^fS;;a*
MHTIJ€N C(pY

FEIAIX I}IIS Otnl Ftf, 5IR]BE{[
IIBITICNIIO{



Statement Summary
Page 1 of 3

WHUYCNC

Peter Fletcher
2lXl29 Ventura Boulevard
Woodland Htlls, CA 91364, US

$30.10

Gurrent Charges:

Bill Date:
Usage Period: Total Gharg€s: $31-41

At Grasshopper, we know that entrepreneurs just like you can change the world, one small business at a time'

That,s why we started the Entrepreneur Movement. Watch the video at and tell everyone you know about

GrasshopPer.

o5l1z20
o4t12120 - 05112120

Questionsaboutyouru[?-GatusanyrimeTdl-Freear(8m)2791455.lntemationdcailersdial+1'617-27'$2455'
cowright 2020 Gras$lloPPer GGry, [c' A[ RigtrE Reseryed

Grasshopper



Statement SummarY
Page 2 of 3

Grasshopper

Date
o5112120

Type
Domestic

lncluded
0 minutes

Detail
Monfrly Payment, Paid on Master Card ending in 7895 ' """"""' ."" $31'41

Total Payments & Credits: $31'41

Current Period

Total Recurring Charges: 522-00

Overage
37 minutes

Rate
0,06

Charge
$2_22
$2.22Total Minute Charges:

Charge
Type
Tax
Tax
Tax
Tax
Tax
Tax
Tax
Tax
Surcharge

Detail
LJff ity Users Tax....-.............
CA Teleconnect Fund .....----..-...

Universal Lifeline Telephone Service Charge " " " " " "
CA High Cost Fund A.....---...-.-.....-

FCC Regulatory Fee (Wneline).

CATRS
CA PUC Fee........-....-...
Regulatory Recovery Fee.......'...'.....

Total Taxes & Surchalges:

$1.57
$0.06
$0.44
$0.03
$0.02
$0.04
$0.04
$o.02
$3.75
$5.97

Type
Surcharge

Detail
Fed Universal Service Fund... .."'... ..

Total Federal USF Contributions:

Charge
$1.22
s'|.22

Number
+18.t 863991444

Total Minutes Used:
37
37

Do;eltic, Calls that are placed inside the United States and

its provinces.

Off Shore: Calls placed outside of U.S- borders-

Volce Over: Use of voice talents for recording of main greeting

or extensions.

Bonus tinutes: Extra minutes that are credited to your

account.

lntemational: calls placed from a country other than the U.S. Set Up Support: Help setting up your account and customizing

your feafures.

Federal Universal Service Fun d The USF contribuiion factor

established by the Federal Communications Commission is

cln6tisls about your t iB? - cd us any{ime Tol1Fr€e et (gx}) 27i91456- ffinraford cders did +'1417-zl*2455'

Copydght 2020 Grshopper Group, LLG' AE Riglrts Reserved'

Summary



Statement Summary
Page 3 of 3

applicable to telecommunications services and is adjusted by

the FCC every calendar quarter

Clnestions about your tir? - Cd us a4rtirrc ToE#ree at (en) 21r$14-56. lnEnrational cdlers did +1617-27y2ffi-
Copyright 202{l GrasshoPPer Group, LLG. Alt Rights Reserued

Grasshopper



From : semee.park@lacity.org,

To: s.kaufman@whcouncil.org,

Gc: Vanessa.Senan@lacity.org, derkncfi.rndirB@laoty-org, p-lawler@rhcouncil.org, j.fletcherr@ntrmrncil.org,

Suliect Re: WHWCITIC - Approval d Emergency Fundirg
Date: Thu, Apr 30, 2O2O 4:37 pm

Thank you Shep.

The Department is formally approving these requests.

Be well, and healthy.

Semee Park
Director of Neighborhood Council Operations

Department of Neighborhood Empowerment
14410 Sylvan St. 3rd Floor
Los Angeles, CA 91401
Offrce l8l8-374-6851
Email I Semee.Park{ri lactr) .oIg

Trailblaing lhe largest civic engagement system, virtuolly
wwu'. Empltrye_rLA.a.rg E VG

On Thu. Apr 30, 2020 at I0:08 AM s.kaufman@)whcouncil.org <s.kaufman(lwhcouncil.org> wrote:
Good Morning Semee,
Thank you for the quick response. See below in ' 

' for answers to your questions:

Thank you,
Shep

Sheppard Kaulinan
VP, Woodland Hills-Warner Center Neighborhood Council
Chair, Public Safety Committee

s.kaufman@u.hcouncil. org
310-266-0576 mobile

On Apr 29.2020, at 5:32 PM. Semee Park <semee.park(alacity.o.rg> wrote:

Dear Sheppard,

Thank you for Woodland Hills Wamer Center NC's submission of the COVID-19 Emergency Funding Plan.

The Department of Neighborhood Empowerment (Department) is preliminarily approving your submission on
behalf of WHWCNC. Final approval will be provided upon confirmation no conflict of interest exists, and follow
up questions answered. Attached is/are your submission(s) for your reference. I will send another email to
the Board informing them of the Department's approval.

Couple of follow up questions needed to approve your proposal:

.WhofromWoodlandHillsWamerCenterNChastheP-card?

1. Los Angeles Fire Department Foundation - $500 to support the purchase of Personal
Protective Equipment (PPE) for LAFD personnel responding to COViDl9



ED;
. can you conflrm no conflict of interest exists between you and the organizffi confirnted' No

contiict exists' not' Funding Team can assist with

. ls the organization able to

a check Yes, iheY ca* a

,anr^/ nirrchase additio;i?@' .

Valley Food Pantry -.$1,10^0. L"^l*'the 
pantry purchase additional food/ 2. W"stValley Food Pantry - sl'uurr !.e-rl

,"*-"t"0 n""d fo' support during COVIDl9

, . Can you confirm no conflict of interest exists between you and the orOanizatill? .. - -";"-"-":-

' ls the organization able to accep ]yl91s-Ulttcard? 
ff ricit' funOing Team can assist

to hold a meeting via teleconference or other

",wtOin"" 
to tre govemirg board'

*,{lm*:s;rffi fffllg'&",ffi ' 
o'

meeting.

We trope th'E is hdpfi.tl, ard hok fuuad b your reply'

check -

Semee Park

Director of Neighborhood Council Operations

Department of Neighborhood Empowerment

14410 Sylvan St. 3rd Floor

Los Angeles, CA 91401

Office l8l8-37+6E5t
Email I Semee.Park@ledJy'o-rg

Traitblaung rhe largest civic engagement systet"' virtually

rvww.ErnPPYerLA. oJg,lEVG
.ISn"pp*d--f uofr nan-Woodland-Hills-Warner-Center
Wamer-Center (1).Pdf>

pdF<Sheppard-Kaufi nan-Woodland-Hills-



From: execdkector@westvalleyfoodpanty.org,

To: lmbrpaul@aol.cun, s.kaufrnan@rhcouncfl .org,

Subiect Re: Woodland Hills Payirg for groceries at Smart & Final fur the West Valley Food

IE: Wed, May 13, Z)20 5:11 Pm

Josh Harrison is the store manager. He has the paperwork!
Thanks Paul!
Debbie

],'-; I 1, 'l'r, l,:' 
-r.'l ,1 ' I 11'r r:" 1;.11 ". li'li

Original message

From: Paul Lawler <lawlerpaul@aol.com>
Date:5113120 5:00 PM (GMT-08:00)
To : execdirector@we s tval leyfoodpantry. org, s.kaufman@whcouncil. org
Subject: Re: Woodland Hills Paying for groceries at Smart & Final for the West Valley Food Pantry?

,Hi 
Debbie

Got it who should I talk to?
I was out of the office today.
First thing tomonow.
They open at 6 AM tomorrow.

Best Regards,
Paul Lawler

Paul Lawler Risk Management
6351 Owensmouth Suite 104
Woodland Hills, CA 91367
(818) 222-8222

---Otiginal ttiessa ge-
To: lawlerpaul@aol. com
Sent: Wed, May 13, 2O2O 4:OS pm
Subjecf Woodland Hills Paying for groceries at Smart & Fina! br the West Valley Food Pan@

Hi Paul,
You wanted to know when to go to pay for the groceries at Smart and Fina!. They have anived at the store and
await you gptng in to Brt it on the WH,WNC credit card! I've left you a couple of messages on the phone but
haventt heard back from you so ! trought l'd send you and email. Let me knor when you've paid for it and we'll
go and pick it up!
THANK YOU SO MUCH!!!

Debbie Decker
Executive Director and
Chief Operating Afrcer
West Yalley Food Pantry
Prince of Peace Church
5700 RudnickAve.
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